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Message from the Guest Editor

Prematurity is defined as a birth that occurs before 37
completed weeks (less than 259 days) of gestation. It is
associated with a considerable risk of morbidity and
mortality, particularly among extremely preterm infants
(i.e., gestational age <28 weeks). Complications of the
preterm infant are divided into short-term complications
(e.g., respiratory and cardiovascular complications) that
occur in the neonatal period, and long-term sequelae (e.g.,
neurodevelopmental disabilities such as cerebral palsy) in
patients who survive and are discharged from the neonatal
intensive care unit (NICU).  Advances in neonatal intensive
care have improved the survival rate of preterm infants
born at an increasingly younger gestational age. Advances
in technology, surgical techniques, and therapeutics have
dramatically changed the management, timing of
treatment, and outcomes of common neonatal diseases.
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Message from the Editor-in-Chief

You are cordially invited to submit research articles, short
communications, comprehensive reviews, case reports or
interesting images for consideration and publication in
Diagnostics (ISSN 2075-4418). Diagnostics is published in
open access format – research articles, reviews and other
contents are released on the Internet immediately aCer
acceptance. The scientific community and the general
public have unlimited and free access to the content as
soon as it is published. We would be pleased to welcome
you as one of our authors.
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